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"A Japanese writer of genius."—Japan Quarterly

Soseki Natsume is considered to be one of Japan's most beloved and respected authors. And Then is ranked
as one of his most insightful and stirring novels.

Daisuke, the protagonist, is a man in his twenties who is struggling with his personal purpose and identity as
well as the changing social landscape of Meiji-era Japan. As Japan enters the Twentieth Century, ancient
customs give way to western ideals, and Daisuke works to resolve his feelings of disconnection and
abandonment during this time of change. Thanks to his father's wealth, Daisuke has the luxury of having
time to develop his philosophies and ruminate on their meaning while remaining intellectually aloof from
traditional Japanese culture and the demands of growing industrialization. Then Daisuke's life takes an
unexpected turn when he is reunited with his college friend and his sickly wife. At first, Daisuke's stoicism
allows him to act according to his intellect, but his intellectual fortress begins to show its vulnerabilities as
his emotions start to hold greater sway over his inner life. Daisuke must now weigh his choices in a culture
that has always operated on the razor's edge of societal obligation and personal freedom.
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From reader reviews:

Thomas Rinaldi:

Hey guys, do you really wants to finds a new book to read? May be the book with the headline And Then
(Tuttle Classics) suitable to you? The actual book was written by renowned writer in this era. The book
untitled And Then (Tuttle Classics)is the one of several books that will everyone read now. This specific
book was inspired a lot of people in the world. When you read this guide you will enter the new shape that
you ever know prior to. The author explained their plan in the simple way, therefore all of people can easily
to understand the core of this reserve. This book will give you a lot of information about this world now. To
help you to see the represented of the world within this book.

Kathleen Duff:

Reading a book being new life style in this season; every people loves to examine a book. When you read a
book you can get a lots of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your knowledge, mainly
because book has a lot of information on it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of book
that you have read. In order to get information about your analysis, you can read education books, but if you
act like you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, this sort of us novel, comics, in addition
to soon. The And Then (Tuttle Classics) provide you with new experience in examining a book.

Beth Sanders:

In this era which is the greater person or who has ability in doing something more are more special than
other. Do you want to become considered one of it? It is just simple strategy to have that. What you need to
do is just spending your time not much but quite enough to have a look at some books. One of the books in
the top list in your reading list is definitely And Then (Tuttle Classics). This book that is certainly qualified
as The Hungry Inclines can get you closer in becoming precious person. By looking upwards and review this
guide you can get many advantages.

Karen Delamora:

As we know that book is important thing to add our information for everything. By a publication we can
know everything you want. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year has
been exactly added. This publication And Then (Tuttle Classics) was filled with regards to science. Spend
your extra time to add your knowledge about your scientific research competence. Some people has diverse
feel when they reading some sort of book. If you know how big advantage of a book, you can truly feel enjoy
to read a e-book. In the modern era like today, many ways to get book which you wanted.
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