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Follow Sandra and friends as they navigate life, love, and their late-twenties in Germany's hip Berlin.

After more or less fulfilling Simone Kohl's request, Sandra looks at her own love life and is heartbroken. Her
melancholy only intensifies as she watches her parents move into their new nest like lovebirds. If that were
not enough, her back pain has returned. Sandra desperately needs a distraction. But alas, in seeking an
unlikely diversion, Sandra is caught off guard by her parents and has some explaining to do...

The Coffee Shop - a cozy café in Germany's capital, Berlin - just happens to be the best office in the world.
From here, Sandra practices her quirky trade as a "finder-of things." She caters to customers who have lost or
want to find something that's missing from their lives. Doric Colums as an engagement gift? Check. Missing
childhood photos? Done. But in her quest to grant other people's wishes, Sandra suddenly finds herself in
search of her own happiness - and of herself. Toss in a dead goose, and it's the perfect recipe for romantic
disaster.

Berlin Coffee Shop is a new digital serial novel for fans of "Sex and the City," "Friends," and "How I met
your Mother." The story is told in six parts, as each novella builds upon the next. Berlin Coffee Shop is
produced by German publishing house, Bastei Luebbe in cooperation with TV production company Saxonia
Media GmbH.

Author Gerlis Zillgens lives in Germany and has written novels and screenplays and developed TV series.
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From reader reviews:

Mary Davis:

Book is to be different for every grade. Book for children till adult are different content. As you may know
that book is very important usually. The book Berlin Coffee Shop - Episode 4: Better Half has been making
you to know about other understanding and of course you can take more information. It is quite advantages
for you. The book Berlin Coffee Shop - Episode 4: Better Half is not only giving you considerably more new
information but also to be your friend when you really feel bored. You can spend your spend time to read
your publication. Try to make relationship with the book Berlin Coffee Shop - Episode 4: Better Half. You
never really feel lose out for everything when you read some books.

Adam Sea:

The book Berlin Coffee Shop - Episode 4: Better Half will bring one to the new experience of reading some
sort of book. The author style to describe the idea is very unique. In case you try to find new book to read,
this book very suitable to you. The book Berlin Coffee Shop - Episode 4: Better Half is much recommended
to you to study. You can also get the e-book from the official web site, so you can more readily to read the
book.

Donovan Houseman:

Would you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store?
Try to pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't evaluate book by its protect may
doesn't work at this point is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not since fantastic as in
the outside appear likes. Maybe you answer might be Berlin Coffee Shop - Episode 4: Better Half why
because the amazing cover that make you consider in regards to the content will not disappoint an individual.
The inside or content is actually fantastic as the outside as well as cover. Your reading sixth sense will
directly assist you to pick up this book.

Kathleen Knight:

As a university student exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the
library as well as to make summary for some guide, they are complained. Just small students that has
reading's spirit or real their leisure activity. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to go to the
library. They go to generally there but nothing reading critically. Any students feel that examining is not
important, boring in addition to can't see colorful pictures on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is
very important in your case. As we know that on this time, many ways to get whatever we would like.
Likewise word says, many ways to reach Chinese's country. Therefore this Berlin Coffee Shop - Episode 4:
Better Half can make you truly feel more interested to read.
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