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What caused an ex-militant Muslim who fought Christians during the Lebanese Civil War to leave his
baggage of hatred behind and learn to love his enemies?

AN EX-ISLAMIC MILITANT'S JOURNEY OF FAITH

Jerry Rassamni's story begins with his "physical Jihad" (physical struggle) against Christians during the
bloody Lebanese  Civil War. After recounting his gripping early years, the narrative briskly shifts to Jerry's
"personal Jihad" (spiritual struggle into enlightenment) as he attempted to refute the Bible. This book reveals
the gripping evidence that led Jerry to abandon Islam and embrace Christ at his Lord and Savior.

While describing his search for the truth, Jerry exposes the pagan roots of the Muslim god and the feet of
clay of its founder, while providing a careful apologetic for Christianity, Jerry shares the evidence the
evidence that compelled him to abandon Islam and undrapes the "Five pillars" to expose the skeletons of
Islam:

* Allah, is he the eternal God of the Bible?

* The Qur'an, it is the true word of God?

* The prophet Muhammad, was he a Biblical prophet?

* Man, is he born in fitrab (pure state)?

* Abadith (Muslim customs & beliefs), are they from God?
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From reader reviews:

Bob Bartlett:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With reading through you can get a
lot of information that could give you benefit in your life. Using book everyone in this world can share their
idea. Guides can also inspire a lot of people. Many author can inspire their reader with their story or maybe
their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the textbooks. But also they write about the ability about
something that you need example. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your kids, there are many
kinds of book that you can get now. The authors on this planet always try to improve their skill in writing,
they also doing some study before they write on their book. One of them is this From Jihad to Jesus: An Ex-
militant's Journey of Faith.

Erik Herrera:

The book with title From Jihad to Jesus: An Ex-militant's Journey of Faith has a lot of information that you
can find out it. You can get a lot of help after read this book. This particular book exist new know-how the
information that exist in this e-book represented the condition of the world right now. That is important to
yo7u to learn how the improvement of the world. That book will bring you with new era of the globalization.
You can read the e-book on the smart phone, so you can read the idea anywhere you want.

Arnulfo Walls:

Many people spending their time period by playing outside with friends, fun activity using family or just
watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to invest your whole day by examining a book. Ugh,
do you consider reading a book can definitely hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It
alright you can have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Cell phone. Like From Jihad to
Jesus: An Ex-militant's Journey of Faith which is having the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's
view.

Dora Mohammed:

That guide can make you to feel relax. This book From Jihad to Jesus: An Ex-militant's Journey of Faith was
colorful and of course has pictures on the website. As we know that book From Jihad to Jesus: An Ex-
militant's Journey of Faith has many kinds or style. Start from kids until adolescents. For example Naruto or
Detective Conan you can read and think you are the character on there. Therefore , not at all of book are
make you bored, any it makes you feel happy, fun and rest. Try to choose the best book to suit your needs
and try to like reading that will.
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