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The early Christian Church was a chaos of contending beliefs. Some groups of Christians claimed that there
was not one God but two or twelve or thirty. Some believed that the world had not been created by God but
by a lesser, ignorant deity. Certain sects maintained that Jesus was human but not divine, while others said he
was divine but not human.

In Lost Christianities, Bart D. Ehrman offers a fascinating look at these early forms of Christianity and
shows how they came to be suppressed, reformed, or forgotten. All of these groups insisted that they upheld
the teachings of Jesus and his apostles, and they all possessed writings that bore out their claims, books
reputedly produced by Jesus's own followers. Modern archaeological work has recovered a number of key
texts, and as Ehrman shows, these spectacular discoveries reveal religious diversity that says much about the
ways in which history gets written by the winners. Ehrman's discussion ranges from considerations of
various "lost scriptures"--including forged gospels supposedly written by Simon Peter, Jesus's closest
disciple, and Judas Thomas, Jesus's alleged twin brother--to the disparate beliefs of such groups as the
Jewish-Christian Ebionites, the anti-Jewish Marcionites, and various "Gnostic" sects. Ehrman examines in
depth the battles that raged between "proto-orthodox Christians"--those who eventually compiled the
canonical books of the New Testament and standardized Christian belief--and the groups they denounced as
heretics and ultimately overcame.

Scrupulously researched and lucidly written, Lost Christianities is an eye-opening account of politics, power,
and the clash of ideas among Christians in the decades before one group came to see its views prevail.
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From reader reviews:

Connie Bannister:

Book will be written, printed, or created for everything. You can learn everything you want by a book. Book
has a different type. We all know that that book is important issue to bring us around the world. Alongside
that you can your reading proficiency was fluently. A publication Lost Christianities: The Battles for
Scripture and the Faiths We Never Knew will make you to end up being smarter. You can feel more
confidence if you can know about everything. But some of you think in which open or reading some sort of
book make you bored. It is not make you fun. Why they can be thought like that? Have you seeking best
book or appropriate book with you?

Ilene Venne:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside using friends, fun activity with family or just
watching TV the entire day. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by reading a book. Ugh, do
you think reading a book really can hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It fine you can
have the e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like Lost Christianities: The
Battles for Scripture and the Faiths We Never Knew which is finding the e-book version. So , try out this
book? Let's find.

John Lee:

That guide can make you to feel relax. This book Lost Christianities: The Battles for Scripture and the Faiths
We Never Knew was colourful and of course has pictures on the website. As we know that book Lost
Christianities: The Battles for Scripture and the Faiths We Never Knew has many kinds or variety. Start from
kids until youngsters. For example Naruto or Private investigator Conan you can read and believe you are the
character on there. Therefore , not at all of book are make you bored, any it makes you feel happy, fun and
chill out. Try to choose the best book to suit your needs and try to like reading this.

Ann Foley:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher asked them to go to the library in order to make
summary for some publication, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's internal or real
their hobby. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to the library. They go to presently there but
nothing reading very seriously. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring as well as can't see
colorful photographs on there. Yeah, it is to be complicated. Book is very important to suit your needs. As
we know that on this period, many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise word says, ways to reach
Chinese's country. So , this Lost Christianities: The Battles for Scripture and the Faiths We Never Knew can
make you sense more interested to read.
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