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Imagine a set of simple principles that could help you to understand how parts combine to become a whole,
and how each part sees the whole from its own perspective. If such principles were any good, it shouldn’t
matter whether we’re talking about humans on a team, birds in a flock, computers in a datacenter, or cogs in
a Swiss watch. A theory of cooperation ought to be pretty universal, so we should be able to apply it both to
technology and to the workplace.

Such principles are the subject of Promise Theory, and the focus of this insightful book. The goal of Promise
Theory is to reveal the behavior of a whole from the sum of its parts, taking the viewpoint of the parts rather
than the whole. In other words, it is a bottom-up, constructionist view of the world. Start Thinking in
Promises and find out why this discipline works for documenting system behaviors from the bottom-up.
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From reader reviews:

Adrian Woodson:

Here thing why that Thinking in Promises are different and trustworthy to be yours. First of all studying a
book is good but it really depends in the content than it which is the content is as delicious as food or not.
Thinking in Promises giving you information deeper and in different ways, you can find any publication out
there but there is no book that similar with Thinking in Promises. It gives you thrill examining journey, its
open up your own personal eyes about the thing in which happened in the world which is possibly can be
happened around you. You can easily bring everywhere like in park, café, or even in your approach home by
train. Should you be having difficulties in bringing the published book maybe the form of Thinking in
Promises in e-book can be your alternate.

Phillip Patten:

A lot of people always spent their particular free time to vacation or even go to the outside with them loved
ones or their friend. Do you realize? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just watching TV, or
perhaps playing video games all day long. If you need to try to find a new activity that's look different you
can read a book. It is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book that you simply read you can spent the whole
day to reading a book. The book Thinking in Promises it doesn't matter what good to read. There are a lot of
those who recommended this book. These were enjoying reading this book. When you did not have enough
space to deliver this book you can buy the particular e-book. You can m0ore simply to read this book from a
smart phone. The price is not to cover but this book possesses high quality.

Aaron Powers:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always aim to and must have the spare time or they will get lots of
stress from both daily life and work. So , if we ask do people have extra time, we will say absolutely yes.
People is human not really a robot. Then we question again, what kind of activity do you possess when the
spare time coming to anyone of course your answer will unlimited right. Then do you ever try this one,
reading guides. It can be your alternative within spending your spare time, the particular book you have read
is usually Thinking in Promises.

Gail Delamora:

E-book is one of source of knowledge. We can add our knowledge from it. Not only for students but in
addition native or citizen want book to know the revise information of year to be able to year. As we know
those books have many advantages. Beside we add our knowledge, can bring us to around the world.
Through the book Thinking in Promises we can take more advantage. Don't you to be creative people? To
get creative person must love to read a book. Just simply choose the best book that acceptable with your aim.
Don't be doubt to change your life at this time book Thinking in Promises. You can more pleasing than now.
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