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Fans of Amanda Hocking's novel, Wake, will dive into this paranormal romance featuring mermaids--
the killer kind--and won't come up for air!

Calder White lives in the cold, clear waters of Lake Superior, the only brother in a family of murderous
mermaids. To survive, Calder and his sisters prey on humans and absorb their positive energy. Usually, they
select their victims at random, but this time around, the underwater clan chooses its target for a reason:
revenge. They want to kill Jason Hancock, the man they blame for their mother's death.

It's going to take a concerted effort to lure the aquaphobic Hancock onto the water. Calder's job is to gain
Hancock's trust by getting close to his family. Relying on his irresistible good looks and charm, Calder sets
out to seduce Hancock's daughter Lily. Easy enough, but Calder screws everything up by falling in love--just
as Lily starts to suspect there's more to the monster-in-the-lake legends than she ever imagined, and just as
the mermaids threaten to take matters into their own hands, forcing Calder to choose between them and the
girl he loves.

One thing's for sure: whatever Calder decides, the outcome won't be pretty.

"Riveting! A cold-blooded tale of secrets, revenge, and forbidden love that will leave you terrified to go in
the water."--Gretchen McNeil, author of Possess

"Scary and spooky . . . I really enjoyed reading this."--USA Today

“A haunting tale of revenge and romance.”--Justine Magazine

From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Beatrice Pearson:

Book is definitely written, printed, or illustrated for everything. You can realize everything you want by a
guide. Book has a different type. We all know that that book is important thing to bring us around the world.
Alongside that you can your reading proficiency was fluently. A publication Lies Beneath will make you to
become smarter. You can feel far more confidence if you can know about every thing. But some of you think
in which open or reading any book make you bored. It's not make you fun. Why they may be thought like
that? Have you looking for best book or suited book with you?

Bonnie Fernandez:

Information is provisions for individuals to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone at
everywhere. The information can be a knowledge or any news even a huge concern. What people must be
consider whenever those information which is inside the former life are challenging to be find than now is
taking seriously which one works to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you have the
unstable resource then you buy it as your main information it will have huge disadvantage for you. All those
possibilities will not happen throughout you if you take Lies Beneath as the daily resource information.

Karen Baskin:

The guide with title Lies Beneath has a lot of information that you can understand it. You can get a lot of
benefit after read this book. This kind of book exist new information the information that exist in this guide
represented the condition of the world right now. That is important to yo7u to understand how the
improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you inside new era of the globalization. You can
read the e-book on your smart phone, so you can read this anywhere you want.

Karen Perl:

Reading a book to become new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to examine a book. When you
examine a book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your knowledge, due to
the fact book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what types of book
that you have read. If you want to get information about your review, you can read education books, but if
you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, and soon. The Lies
Beneath will give you new experience in looking at a book.
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